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DESCRIPTION
Cancer is one of the most serious and complex diseases 
frequently associated with a wide range of symptoms that can 
significantly affects a patient’s quality of life. Among these 
symptoms, cancer-related pain stands out as one of the most 
distressing, impacting both physical and emotional well-being.

Nature and types of cancer pain

Cancer pain can vary widely in intensity, location and duration. 
It is frequently classified into three types. Nociceptive pain is a 
type of pain occurs when cancer invades tissues or organs, 
stimulating pain receptors in the affected areas. Nociceptive pain 
is additionally divided into somatic and visceral pain. Somatic 
pain originates in the bones, muscles or skin and is usually 
described as sharp, aching or throbbing. Visceral pain arises 
from internal organs such as the stomach, liver or intestines and 
is generally described as a deep, cramping or squeezing 
sensation.

Neuropathic pain results from nerve damage caused by the 
cancer treatments, such as chemotherapy or radiation therapy. 
This type of pain is frequently described as burning, shooting or 
tingling and it may be more challenging to treat than nociceptive 
pain. Neuropathic pain can be persistent or intermittent and it 
may arise even when no external stimuli are present.

Breakthrough pain refers to sudden, intense episodes of pain 
that occur even when a patient is already taking medication to 
control chronic cancer pain. Breakthrough pain can last 
anywhere from a few minutes to several hours and frequently 
requires additional medication or adjustments in pain 
management techniques to maintain it under control.

Causes of cancer pain

Cancer pain may be caused by the tumor treatments or 
complications related to the disease. Understanding the 
underlying cause of the pain is essential for developing 
appropriate treatment strategies.

Tumor growth and invasion: As tumors grow, they can invade 
and compress nearby tissues, organs or nerves, causing pain. For 
example, bone metastases (when cancer spreads to the bones) are 
a common source of cancer-related pain. Tumors pressing 
against nerves, muscles or other organs can also lead to 
significant discomfort.

Cancer treatments: Treatments for cancer, including surgery, 
chemotherapy and radiation therapy, can sometimes cause pain. 
Surgery can result in post-operative pain from the incision site or 
tissue trauma. Chemotherapy can cause neuropathy, particularly 
in the hands and feet, as some chemotherapeutic drugs damage 
peripheral nerves. Radiation therapy may lead to pain in the 
treated area, especially if it causes inflammation, tissue damage 
or fibrosis (thickening of tissues).

Infection or inflammation: Cancer patients, especially those 
with compromised immune systems due to chemotherapy or 
radiation, are at higher risk of infections, which can result in 
pain. Inflammation caused by the immune response to cancer 
can also contribute to pain, particularly in the case of cancers 
that trigger inflammatory processes, such as pancreatic cancer.

Cancer-related complications: Other complications, such as 
blood clots, fractures due to weakened bones (pathologic 
fractures) or bowel obstructions, can cause acute pain. These 
consequences are frequently caused by cancer, but they require 
being treated immediately as possible in order to avoid 
additional pain.

The effect of cancer pain on quality of life

Uncontrolled cancer pain can have life-threatening consequences 
on a patient’s quality of life. It can interfere with daily activities, 
disrupt sleep and lead to a loss of independence. Patients may 
become less able to engage in important activities, which can 
contribute to feelings of isolation, depression and despair. The 
psychological impact of living with constant or severe pain can be 
immense. Anxiety about future pain episodes, fear of worsening 
symptoms and concerns about becoming dependent on pain 
medications can heavy weight on patients and their families. 
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